



City of Johannesburg
Pikitup

Pikitup Head Office
Jorissen Place
66 Jorissen Street
Braamfontein
2001

Private Bag X74 Tel+27(0) 11 712 5200
Braamfontein Fax +27(0) 11 712 5322
Johannesburg www.pikitup.co.za
2017 www.joburg.org.za

BIDS RECEIVED AT CLOSING

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
1	Ngutyana Construction & Project	R 14,105,665.80
2	MACD Logisitics and Projects	R 17,025,938.04
3	Junior Multi Contracts – Inkega JV	R 17,209,826.48
4	Roswika Civils and Construction	R 19,383,494.95
5	Ryancris Trading	R 24,260,489.72
6	Gora Projects	R 12,411,243.80
7	Macho Construction Group	R 11,935,435.77
8	Microzone Projects	R 24,510,462.56
9	Matshelane Gaz Construction	R 17,760,867.07
10	DHD Trading Enterprise	R 22,904,491.72
11	Genco Construction	R 19,606,541.80
12	Earthrumental Pty Ltd	R 29,571,260.00
13	Manqondo Built Enviro	R 10,792,215.00
14	Lacamorra Trading	R 22,961,639.54
15	Makgowa Building and Projects	R 21,514,855.08
16	HBC Construction	R 33,736,866.01
17	No Limit Development	R 22,232,799.33

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
18	Exec Construction	R 18,557,083.34
19	Blackcherry Trading	R 25,843,163.98
20	Tandedza Construction Projects	R 9,646,623.48
21	Thato Ya Bagotsi Investment	R 23,441,448.89
22	Magoda Krippa JV	No Bid Price
23	4T Group	R 12,916,711.40
24	Mantelane Construction	R 26,040,596.21
25	R Mahange and Associates	R 20,944,224.39
26	Holoby Trading	R 17,494,988.23
27	Siqoko Trading Enterprise	R 18,318,718.30
28	Xigombe Holdings	R 22,783,860.52
29	Ntshuntso Business Enterprise	R 23, 734,492.80
30	Diff Construction Group	R 28,824,725.79
31	Mahlogo wa Pheladi Business	R 19,021,694.69
32	Mbidzo Civil Construction	R 16,209,084.70
33	Molook's Civils Phefo JV	R 26,820,302.80
34	Rorisang Holdings	R 31,971,020.73
35	Themolo Business Enterprise	R 24,375,099.31
36	Mopicon Construction	R 24,754,961.11
37	AAshpo Projects	R 14,313,369.32
38	Mangadi Solution Pty Ltd	R 22,037,674.00
39	Manong Construction & Projects	R 91, 638,321.19
40	C.T.K. Industrial Projects	R 16,044,279.00
41	Condocor Pty Ltd	R 24,134,923.07
42	Sewele Sa Re Phoo Business	R 28,423,942.80

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
43	KM Mashigo Trading	R 26,965,518.46
44	Imbumba Plant Hire Pty Ltd	R 25,511,072.60
45	Jaira Contractors	R 20,893,768.00
46	Proserve Construction	R 22,946,707.00
47	P&P Communications Uzile JV	R 16,818,217.20
48	Ba Biya Geomatics & Civils	R 17,858,329.30
49	Muponi Property Management	R 15,261,813.33
50	Akani Properties JV	R 17,291,608.33
51	Ngwanashogole Trading Enterprise	R 27,263,310.36
52	Mokgatle Holdings	R 21, 296,479.19
53	Mbhonya Trading and Projects	R 18,109,543.16
54	Nghanghani Construction	R 14,747,039.28
55	Luthongwa Trading	R 18,077,057.12
56	Amahlankomo Construction	No Bid Price
57	GST Office Refurb	R 20,655,080.31
58	M2M Projects	R 25, 070, 801.12
59	Epic Engineering	R 12,609,985.91
60	Gale Consulting JV Makeke	R 19,931,809.48
61	Hillpet	R 24, 147,579.07
62	Delirium Promotions	R 17,960,861.25
63	Makhado Projects	R 15,378,232.07
64	Oxior Civil Enterprise	R 16,411,722.91
65	Coxinell IPP	R 13,503,884.11
66	Malerate Construction	R 14,125,132.41
67	Firstworks 119 Pty Ltd	R 15,540,860.31

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
68	FCM Building Contractors	R 15,614,783.49
69	Tefla Group	R 21,647,070.33
70	Kenny Ronny Construction FB JV	R 13,654,555.50
71	Bakoena Construction Techniques JV	R 12,656,199.77
72	Mihandzu Consulting and Projects	R 24,350,365.00
73	Mshandukani Holdings	R 18,831,260.37
74	Setsumi Agency and Trading	R 15,834,738.70
75	TBM Infrastructure Pty Ltd	R 23,464,796.76
76	Siyathuthuka Sonke JV	R 21,904,429.00
77	Lazerbane Trading cc	R 15,853,192.92
78	Just Right Trading	R 25,096,676.21
79	Libone JV Khuluphala	R 21,320,313.06
80	SSS Invest	R 29,320,313.06
81	Protumi Construction	R 18,158,149.71
82	SA.Monare-Boitshoko JV	R 22,997,110.75
83	Khombisa Enterprise	R 16,029,417.39
84	Masston Construction Projects	R 18,850,206.95
85	Vapopax Pty Ltd	R 19,190,904.01
86	Brevimode Pty Ltd	No Bid Price
87	Mayibuye I-Africa	R 27,368,835.86
88	SKS Business	R 29, 342,742.03
89	Thaba and Sons Projects	R 11,872,625.63
90	Rebeilwe Investment	R 13,532,887.96
91	Reabetswe Group	R 24,862,573.06
92	Dainah and Joice Business	R 14,737,066.34

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
93	Sebata-Sebatana Business	R 24,596,870.70
94	Tarcron Projects	R 27,875,008.34
95	Alf-Zim & Associates	R 24,888,056.78
96	Manyaka Trading	R 22,939,154.18
97	Sagetrans – Umhlaba Construction JV	R 30,351,993.16
98	La Natura Pty Ltd	R 15,995,149.00
99	RAPDL Construction	R 16,489,882.08
100	Khavhakone Construction	R 21,908,773.17
101	Magic Engineers	No Bid Price
102	KKLL IT Solutions	R 25,843,163.98
103	Southern Ambitions 1700	R 15,453,130.31
104	Matimba Projects Management	R 18,880,788.00
105	Magoshi Consultancy	R 17,975,991.35
106	Nkateko Group	R 17,306,459.37
107	Pro-Contracts	R 23,744,641.02
108	SMC Constructions	R 26,093,665.48
109	KPA Civils	R 23,796,871.75
110	Masheleni Trading	R 14,861,291.44
111	KSTO Holdings	R 32,455,979.37
112	Tirhisano Civil & Projects JV	R 21,391,246.80
113	The Blackprint Investment	R 63, 052,824.71
114	Silidi Projects	R 22,947,364.85
115	Technomobile cc	R 18,780,687.20
116	Mkhonde Group	R 10,866,781.01
117	Gochi Trading	R 21,601,987.20

PU084/2020 – Panel of Contractors Bids Received

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

Number	Name of Bidder	Bidding Price
118	Tshello Trading	R 23,626,772.25
119	D Mthombeni's Construction	R 20,113,594.00
120	Faya Combo Pty Ltd	R 17,397,235.23
121	DCM Projects	R 18,092,203.19
122	Gaborena Construction	R 23,233,247.35
123	TM Consortium	R 21,428,315.71
124	Siviwe Jayiya Construction	R 23,158,484.66
125	Shumela Phanda/Ngungwa JV	R 16,488,709.49
126	Lenong Civil Engineering JV Mdaka	R 19,201,356.86
127	Uyapo Engineering	R 27,267,581.91
128	Baithusi Trading 119	R 19,314,663.02
129	Green Seed Projects	R 15,831,795.19
130	Nexsia Joint Venture	R 22,559,765.22
131	Memoir Construction	R 28,017,186.20
132	Swihluke General Construction	R 16,988,370.63
133	Musawenkosi Supply and Projects	R 15,962,847.90
134	KGabo Developers	R 27,812,266.68
135	Solmix SA Pty Ltd	R 14,825,957.41
136	Manyawusi Trading Enterprise	R 25,269,854.06
137	Maleko Projects and Constructions	R 9,243,117.66
138	Ndimantuli Pty Ltd	R 19,212,377.25
139	Mangatlu Trading	R 17,306,459.37
140	Makheleni Construction /Nozifo JV	R 20,878,670.70
141	Mlo Investments	R 12,885,611.86
142	CV Chabane and Associates	R 26,566,933.21
143	Masemenya Trading	R 18,900,693.60

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

144	Siimanyiwa Trading	R 20,878,670.70
145	Abram Mashego Construction JV	R 17,365,088.23
146	Ngoda Trading	R 14,997,619.62
147	Totobela Trading	R 25,086,571.02
148	Luphunyane Logistics	R 25,742,071.02
149	Gvarait Trading	R 23,069,430.56
150	Xihlala Trading Solutions	R 28,824,725.79
151	Leano Construction Solutions	R 18,261,229.71
152	Drop Dot Pty Ltd	R 19,960,286.93
153	Piwana Holdings	R 21,311,596.34
154	Tinongo Trading Enterprise	R 21,037,478.95
155	Khokhelani Projects	R 25,568,636.21
156	Chrisyd Construction and Projects	R 21,750,389.86
157	Malindo Civil and Construction	R 14,584,099.00
158	Dolly-Shwings Construction JV	R 17,630,995.33
159	Mogale Solutions Providers	R 23,961,112.91
160	TAC Group	R 19,496,742.33
161	Segabokeng Building Construction	R 20,190,455.31
162	Mining for Future Civils	R 15,999,672.45
163	Silverwell Business Enterprise	R 19,234,542.33
164	Mafunzwani Construction	R 18,998,562.33
165	777 MPS Logistics	R 19,706,502.33
166	MKF Trading and Projects	R 6, 698,921.00
167	Derca Pty Ltd	R 30,616,088.20
168	PE Qwesha Business Enterprise	R 6, 977,713.25
169	Lusanda Trading	R 15,795,192.07
170	Musenga Investments	R 22,606,508.85

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

171	Dawaila Trading Enterprise	R 28,601,317.66
172	Masana Mashold Projects	R 14,097,117.52
173	MSK Construction	R 17,858,434.13
174	Mfingo Developments	R 18,571,300.35
175	Luphawu Trading	R 18,941,086.78
176	Ndlambili's Construction	R 14,611,908.60
177	Anita Building Construction	R 26,484,718.28
178	Tendiwanga Investments	No bid Price
179	Diba Bes Pty Ltd	R 18,776,767.05
180	Leboneng North Investment Holdings	R 15,379,357.42
181	Phehla Umsebenzi Trading	R 54,821,827.85
182	Amajuda Civils	R 18,097,393.10
183	NKP Properties and Contractors	R 24,079,566.04
184	Realtech Construction	R 25,449,471.16
185	Angarhela Trading and Projects	R 19,653,942.00
186	Thanzanani Trading JV	R 31,984,096.26
187	ML Engineering	R 19,197,604.00
188	SNZN Construction	R 24,496,853.06
189	Riaphela General Services	R 25,833,059.46
190	Mavizo Projects	R 23,447,896.14
191	Nkomaba Trading and Projects	R 16,481,451.71
192	Double Ring JV Cabani Trading	R 16, 891,412.03
193	Ditlou Supplies and Services	R 26,835,368.98
194	Brooklyn Projects 21	R 26,758,216.63
195	Chumba Rocks	R 26,914,225.63
196	Tivanani Trading	R 13,689,003.15
197	Ditshimega Projects	R 14,958,353.57

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

198	Tseke-Marundo JV	R 18,093,956.60
199	Urban Plan Consult	R 14,581,997.36
200	Mikateko Trading Enterprise	R 23,220,100.56
201	Mizana Engineering and Services	R 18,574,858.04
202	Nemotcon Holdings	R 14,739,660.02
203	Jorud Solutions	R 14,902,505.79
204	Nghilazi Group	R 14,970,641.08
205	Jonginkosi Trading and Projects	R 13,335,082.19
206	BICS Engineering and Supply	R 14,474,843.78
207	Leburn Fetsi Construction	No Bid Price
208	NAP Design Pty Ltd	R 23,565,687.20
209	Phumaphi Holdings Pty Ltd	R 32,729,917.13
210	Mangezi Trading Enterprise	R 23,446,928.23
211	Nduvho Construction	R 18,569,241.02
212	Uphill Hwali Construction JV	R 19,256,708.72
213	Khanki Construction and Transport	R 23,212,611.89
214	Moago Construction	R 20,535,207.71
215	Lekgothwane Ramasela Trading	R 14,358,992.00
216	SHB2Y Contracting cc	R 26,463,149.13
217	Zufi Engineering	No Bid Price
218	Maswin Trading Enterprise	R 15,853,192.92
219	Merisma Trading Enterprise	R 23,342,383.84
220	Lufuno Plant JV Sibusile	R 21,485,020.20
221	Shonisani Rambau Construction	R 19,714,473.51
222	Velman Construction	R 33,981,371.41
223	Isigodlo Investment	R 15,007,915.99
224	Thapelo Tihapane Holdings	R 16,931,859.63

PU084/2020 – Panel of Contractors Bids Received

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

225	Dimenges Projects	R 16,172,889.18
226	NBN Civils	R 25,568,636.21
227	Archibold Holdings	R 14,576,288.87
228	KIS Holdings	R 17,773,050.02
229	SEEBO Group	R 21,092,114.93
230	Sesbuyile Projects and Maintenance	R 24,965,214.48
231	Casnan Civils cc	R 25,622,275.77
232	Kgakwana Construction	R 26,855,230.63
233	Sipho-Mlungisi Trading Enterprise	R 20,619,392.91
234	Log – Agoti JV	R 25,387,212.42
235	404 Builders cc	R 23,625,785.55
236	Riverside Chuene Construction	R 14,820,926.00
237	Down Town Spares	No Bid Price
238	Moke Construction	R 18,260,605.95
239	AMK Business Enterprise	R 10,281,510.03
240	MTK3 Trading and Projects	R 18,306,448.24
241	Lokells Construction and Civils	No Bid Price
242	Pilu Holdings	R 22, 537,271.27
243	Amabuyaze Trading and Projects	R 20,999,755.64
244	M8 Logistics and Plant Hire	R 15,861,898.89
245	Oratilwe Developments	R 14,116,591.13
246	Courtesy Management	R 25,645,320.53
247	STP Development and Projects	R 14,716,580.68
248	Ntsako Industries	R 21,281,805.50
249	Bosigogare Construction	R 23,708,616.43
250	Afrilink Building Pty Ltd	R 23,167,475.36

PU084/2020 - APPOINTMENT OF A PANEL OF 20 CONTRACTORS WITH CIDB GRADE 5GB OR HIGHER, ON AN AS AND WHEN REQUIRED BASIS FOR A PERIOD OF 36 MONTHS.

251	Kurima Joint Venture Projects	R 22,109,525.38
252	Kgafela Construction	R 22,649,803.23
253	S.B. Delivery Services	R 22,368,783.68
254	New Africa Labour Hire and Services	R 17,204,852.00
255	Cathymos Engineering Solutions	R 15,976,565.00
256	Yako Warehousing and Projects	R 9,788,734.96
257	Limpopo Supplement	R 15,468,284.48
258	Exxaro Cont. Pty Ltd	R 17,435,145.56
259	Masizile Construction	R 17,171,383.61
260	Maanda – Fhadzo Construction	R 18,131,604.58
261	Makhare Holdings Pty Ltd	R 31,761,687.50